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 Phi Theta Kappa Honor Society Beta Mu Gamma Chapter will be celebrating its 
16th year here at Solano College and is looking for an advisor for fall 2019. Phi Theta 
Kappa better known as PTK is a prestigious honor Society where students must have a 
minimum G.P.A. of 3.5 to be eligible for membership.  Phi Theta Kappa Honor Society 
guarantees students access to benefits that will recognize students’ academic 
accomplishments and provide students with the competitive edge that helps ensure 
future success.  This year over $37 million in exclusive PTK transfer scholarships are 
provided to PTK members. This is accomplished through PTK Connect, a career, 
scholarship and transfer planning tool that is available to all members throughout the 
year.  

 PTK serves to recognize and encourage the academic achievement of two year college 
students and provides opportunities for individual growth and development through 
honors, leadership, and service programming.  Today Phi Theta Kappa is the largest 
honor society in American higher education with more than 1.3 million members and 
1200 chapters located in 50 states, U.S. territories, Canada, and in Germany.  Here at 
Solano College our club provides many diverse activities such as the Better World Book 
Drive where books are collected and sent to Africa, Asia and other parts of the world to 
help stamp out illiteracy. PTK also supports Veterans with gift cards for the Holidays, 
and provides toys to our families at the Children’s Learning Center here on campus.  PTK 
also encourages fellowship and service through Pieology Pizza Fund raisers, Chipotle 
Restaurant Fundraisers and community creek clean ups.  Phi Theta Kappa is a great 
academic Honors Society that encourages scholarship, leadership, and fellowship 
building the future leaders of tomorrow. 

If you are interested in becoming an advisor for PTK: Please contact:  

Dr. David Williams at David.williams@solano.edu  V.P. Solano College Academic Affairs 
/707 864 7000 or 

Larry Bartlow PTK Honor Society President at Lbartlow@students.solano.edu /707-207-
9342 
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